
How does the meeting work at Villa Sandudden

Villa Sandudden is located on Ingarö/Värmdö only 25 min from Stockholm. Car road right to the door,
parking available. You always have the whole Villa Sandudden for yourself from the evening of day 1 to
the morning of departure day. If you are a smaller party, you have one of the two main villas for yourself.
Link to map

We offer a ‘home from home’ environment with tasteful Newport decor and magnificent sea views.
Everything is personalised, each bedroom, bathroom, dining room, conference room is unique and in
absolute top class

You are always on your own! 
This means that you have your own dining rooms, social rooms, accommodation, bar, dance hall,
conference room, outdoor gym, sauna & SPA facility and 44,000 sqm of park-like beautiful lakeside plot
with 400 metres of beach. The silence and privacy make Villa Sandudden equally suitable for meetings,
conferences, kick-offs and private parties with good friends.

https://www.hitta.se/kartan!~59.29223,18.43674,16z/tr!i=32fidDdj/search!i=klpyhmtyz!q=Villa%20Sandudden%20Junkers%20V%C3%A4g%2022%20Ingar%C3%B6!t=single!st=cmp!ai=klpyhmtyz!aic=59.29226:18.43495/tileLayer!l=1?search=Villa%20Sandudden%20Junkers%20V%C3%A4g%2022%20Ingar%C3%B6&st=single&sst=cmp&sids=klpyhmtyz&srb=0


Strandrummet (The beach room) in the picture above is our smaller conference room where you can be
16 people in boardroom seating. Built on a pier next to the shore with the possibility of opening up, it is
probably Sweden's most beautiful conference room. Just as stunning in winter as in summer. 

Our conference rooms have all modern technology such as large 4k screen, video technology, speaker
system, lightning-fast WIFI. You can also mention the fireplace, tap for ice-cold water bubbling or still,
coffee machine if you want a latte, etc. In our conference rooms there is always fruit, nuts, pens, blocks,
flipcharts, Post-it notes, etc. The picture above is from the Orangery conference room where 45 people
can sit at two board tables. Maximum capacity is 60 people in cinema seating.

Sauna & SPA is located on its own pier overlooking the water is the bathhouse with sauna, cosy relaxation
and a delicious jacuzzi for up to 12 people. Enjoy a cold drink on the jetty in our comfortable lounge
furniture. A charcuterie tray is always included. Fully stocked bar. The swimming/SPA facility is always
included in our offer free of charge - and you are always on your own.



Villa Sand - Main villa

World-class dining experiences! 
Nichlas & Oscar, the master chefs behind the Loén brand, are ready to take you on a journey of flavours.
From family-style lunches to exquisite 4-course dinners, each meal is a symphony of delicious flavours
perfectly complemented by our carefully selected wines. Dinner is served in Villa Udden's Orangery, the
Pavilion Tent or in Villa Sand's glass veranda. Of course, nice lunches, wonderful breakfasts, snacks for
pre-drinks and at the bar, morning and afternoon coffee are included in your stay.

After dinner we open the bar which is cosily furnished with comfortable armchairs and sofas. We have a
music system, football games, a space for spontaneous dancing - everything you need for a pleasant
gettogether. You can also have your coffee in peace and quiet in your own lounge. You can dance in your
own room or in the bar. We have powerful music systems controlled by Spotify - all included free of
charge. The picture above shows part of the bar Bakfickan, of course there is a bar counter, standing
tables, etc. The many heaters with insulated floors enable the bar to be open all year round.

Our customers are very satisfied, that's why we basically only get five stars on Google Review.

https://www.google.com/search?hl=sv-SE&gl=se&q=Villa+Sandudden+Konferens,+Junkers+v%C3%A4g+22,+134+62+Ingar%C3%B6&ludocid=1329019931424263335&lsig=AB86z5XngMfygk2UnJL7lygrylVw#lrd=0x46f57febef16fee9:0x1271a0960ff50ca7,1


The tent pavilion - 60 m²

Activities on offer! 
We can also offer a variety of other free activities - take a nice walk or jog in the woods, sit on the jetty
with your toes in the water, borrow a rod and try your luck at fishing from one of the jetties, do a session
together in the outdoor gym, borrow a SUP or rowing boat. Challenge each other to a board game:
boules, cube, tug-of-war, football, table tennis, chess indoors or out, and more - the possibilities are
endless. We can also offer a wide range of activities through our partners: Öppet Hav och
Aktivitetsteamet. For example: Kayaking, team building, laser clay pigeon shooting, various competitions
inside and outside, etc. 

Villa Sandudden - An Archipelago Village - 25 minutes from central Stockholm. Villa Sandudden has
44,000 m2 of beautiful park-like lakefront land with 400 metres of beach. Link to map

Back to homepage Send request Contact us

https://www.hitta.se/kartan!~59.29223,18.43674,16z/tr!i=bsGyJCRY/search!i=klpyhmtyz!q=Villa%20Sandudden%20Junkers%20V%C3%A4g%2022%20Ingar%C3%B6!t=single!st=cmp!ai=klpyhmtyz!aic=59.29226:18.43495/tileLayer!l=1?search=Villa%20Sandudden%20Junkers%20V%C3%A4g%2022%20Ingar%C3%B6&st=single&sst=cmp&sids=klpyhmtyz&srb=0
https://sandudden.se/en/conference/
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